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TO: June Kail, Purchasing Directorf 18204
FROM: Allen Burch, Principal, Lincoln High School PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
DATE: Apri] 17, 2014 LEON COUNTY SCHQOLS
SUBJECT: Bid No. 5255-2014 — Band Uniforms — Lincoln High School
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The Purchasing Department issued an Invitation to Bid to establish a contract for the procurement of
band uniforms and accessories for Lincoln High School.

It is my recommendation that the contract be awarded to Stanbury Uniforms, the sole responsive bidder
in the amount of $46,878.00 which is well within budget.

Should you have any questions regarding this matter, please do not hesitate to contact me at 487-2110,
Thank you for your time and support in the procurement process.

W 279

Allen Burch

Leon County Schools does not discriminate against any person on the basis of gender, marital status, sexual
orientation, race, religion, national origin, age, color or disability.



Bid Tab

Bid No. 5255-2014

Marching Band Uniforms

Department - Lincoln High School
Opening Date: April 15, 2013 2:00PM EST

DeMoulin Stansbury Uniforms

Item # Complete Bid Package Qty. Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1 Jumpsuit 130|No Bid $79.50 $10,335.00
2 Coat — Band Member 120(No Bid $173.20 $20,784.00
3 Coat — Drum Major 10|No Bid $173.20 $1,732.00
4 Coat Front Mirror 130|No Bid $15.00 $1,950.00
5 Shako 130(No Bid $43.80 $5,694.00
6 Plume 130|No Bid $21.60 $2,808.00
7 Shako Carry Box 130(No Bid $11.00 $1,430.00
8 Garment Bag 130|No Bid $16.50 $2,145.00

Total Bid Proposal No Bid $46,878.00

Lead Time - # days to delivery after receipt

of LCSB purchase order No Bid 135 - 165 days

Bidders are hereby notified that failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes and Board Policy 6320.02, or failure to post the bond or other security
required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings. Offers received from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the
above opeing date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

Opened By: Remera Jones-Haynes Date: 4/15/2014

Recorded By: Nancy Scott Date: 4/15/2014




